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NURTURED TO CREATE
INSPIRED TO INNOVATE

DESTINED TO SERVE 

U N I V E R S I T Y  O F  T H E  P H I L I P P I N E S  C E B U

UP NAMING MAHAL

U.P. naming mahal, pamantasang hirang

Ang tinig namin, sana’y inyong dinggin

Malayong lupain, amin mang marating

Di rin magbabago ang damdamin

Di rin magbabago ang damdamin.

Luntian at pula, Sagisag magpakailanman

Ating pagdiwang,[1] bulwagan ng dangal

Humayo’t itanghal, giting at tapang

Mabuhay ang pag-asa ng bayan

Mabuhay ang pag-asa ng bayan.



ORIGINALLY NAMED THE JUNIOR COLLEGE 
OF LIBERAL ARTS IN CEBU CITY, the Universi-
ty of the Philippines Cebu was established on May 
3, 1918. The youngest of UP system’s constituent 
unit (CU) is ready to celebrate its centennial year. 
For the past few months, we have witnessed the 
many changes our community has experienced.

Our history has become proof that, throughout 
hardships and struggles, UP Cebu has stood up 
against the test of times and pushed our limits. 
Looking back, we have grown from adversity and 
change.

Perhaps, the most symbolic of these changes is the 
replacement of our iconic Oblation with the “real” 
one – that is, following National Artist Guillermo 
Tolentino’s original mold. UP System officials and 
alumni have graced this significant event as former 
UP presidents shared words of wisdom and encour-
agement to the youngest CU. Another event was the 
unveiling of the centennial marker and Gratitude 
Wall with the UP Law Class of ’86 who aided UP 
Cebu without hesitation in our time of need. Truly, 
there is no more fitting prelude to commence the 
centennial year with these events.

This commemorative celebration was launched with 
a motorcade with the theme “Unang Siglo: Halad 
sa Katawhan Celebrating Academic Excellence and 
Public Service (1918 – 2018).” Together with the UP 
Cebu family, we travelled from UP Lahug Campus to 
UP SRP. Upon our arrival, we planted endemic trees. 
The event was a success thanks in part to BINHI, 
the flagship environmental program of the Energy 
Development Corporation.  

Looking Back, 
Moving Forward
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To make this centenary year more special, a film 
showing, and art exhibit were organized to empha-
size the artistic relevance in shaping Cebu’s imag-
ination. Our campus has found a niche in the arts 
and creative design. Thus, it is our impetus to foster 
a culture of innovation and inspiration for future 
artists, critics, and filmmakers.

Yet, UP Cebu’s centenary was also the perfect op-
portunity to gather and share their fond memories 
of the university. A dinner and concert were held 
at the Waterfront Cebu City Hotel by the Univer-
sity of the Philippines Alumni Association Cebu 
Chapter. Respected public figures such as Cebu 
Governor Hilario Davide III, Vice Governor Agnes 
Magpale, and Mandaue City Vice Mayor Carlo 
Fortuna graced the event together with UP Ce-
bu’s illustrious list of alumni. We filled Waterfront 
Hotel’s ballroom with joy and laughter as we were 
serenaded by UP Cebu administrators and our 
homegrown chorale, UP Cebu Serenata. 

2018 also became a great time to acknowledge 
the dedication and talent of our students, faculty, 
and staff. That year, we had the Centennial Gawad 
Chancellor. We recognized the commitment and 
passion that our awardees have exhibited since they 
made lasting impacts in their respective pursuits 
in the university. In addition, winners of the Jingle 
and Centennial Song Writing Contest highlighted 
our local talent as they entertained the entire crowd 
during the Centennial Cookout.

These milestones have signified the many accom-
plishments we, as a community, have triumphed. 
Yet, it is our vision to make lasting changes and 
make them more tangible in the campus. Thus, 
it was our mission to improve our physical infra-
structure to better cater the needs of our constitu-
ents.

Just recently, UP Cebu has taken initiatives to 
renovate buildings and classrooms to make an 
environment more conducive to learning. We 
acquired three buses, two vans, and one multipur-
pose vehicle through the Office of Senator Koko 
Pimentel’s Transportation Enhancement Program. 
To accommodate more students who come from 

the provinces, a four-story dormitory has been being 
constructed. This huge facility is expected to house 
224 dormers once operational – something our be-
loved students have been looking forward to.

As a research university that is destined to serve, 
UP Cebu continues to make meaningful strides to 
the community. It is thus imperative that we make 
productive, evidence-based outputs that strongly 
impact people’s lives. For instance, 2018 witnessed 
the birth of CENVI, FireCheck, and STiiTCH as re-
search centers. These have helped stakeholders from 
both private and public sectors to be empowered by 
equipping them with the necessary skills, informa-
tion, and tools that enable them to pursue their goals 
with efficiency and preciseness. The launching of 
these centers has been graced by no less than DOST 
Secretary Fortunato dela Peña with key officials from 
his office and UP System.

In keeping up with the times, our academic commit-
ment is centered on solving real, societal problems 
with science and technology. For instance, CENVI’s 
technical support and high-resolution maps, to-
gether with DOST-ASTI DATOS’ assistance, greatly 
contributed to the search and retrieval operations 
in the devastating landslide in the City of Naga last 
September 2018. In this light, we hope to see more 
students, faculty members, and academic staff make 
studies that are socially relevant and publicly avail-
able.

Since my term started as Chancellor in UP’s young-
est CU – which was renewed at the end of 2018 – I 
take it as a responsibility that we move forward as 
one family towards new horizons. Looking back, UP 
Cebu’s history for the last 100 years has been rough 
but, as a community, it has learned to overcome this 
with resilience. Therefore, we set the bar higher as 
we welcome the next century with a renewed sense 
of hope and purpose. 

Padayon, UP Cebu!

ATTY. LIZA D. CORRO
Chancellor
University of the Philippines Cebu
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UNANG SIGLO, 
HALAD SA KATAWHAN
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