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BAC Resolution Recommending Award

RESOLUTION NO. 2020-11-009

WHEREAS, UP Cebu posted the Invitation to Bid for the “Supply and Delivery of Medical and Disaster Response
Equipment” in G-EPS, UP Cebu website and at a conspicuous place at the premises of UP Cebu continuously for 7
days;

WHEREAS, in response to the said advertisements, there were two (2) bidders purchased bid documents namely
Spring Development Corporation and Josmef Enterprises. There were two (2) bidders who submitted and these two
(2) bids were found eligible;

WHEREAS, there were two (2) bidders who submitted bids which passed the preliminary examination of bids and
will be subjected to post qualification;

WHEREAS, the bid proposal of the following were found to be substantially complying and the arithmetical
calculations of their bids resulted in the following:

Name of Bidder ABC Bid Amount % of Variance
JOSMEF ENTERPRISES from ABC
LOT1
1. 4 units Outdoor Siren Warning System Php 640,000.00 NO BID -
2. 5 units Trauma Kit Php 100,000.00 NO BID -
3. 6 units First Aid Kit Basic Php 24,000.00 NO BID -
4. 2 units Folding Cot Php 12,000.00 NO BID -
5. 1 unit Folding Stretcher Php 8,000.00 NO BID -
6. 2 units Wheelchair Php 12,000.00 NO BID -
7. 30 pcs Hard Hat Php 6,000.00 NO BID -
8. 1 unit Blinker light Php 2,000.00 NO BID -
9. 2 units Megaphone Php 6,000.00 NO BID -
10. 5 pcs Fire blanket Php 5,000.00 NO BID -
11. 5 pcs Thermal Blanket Php 500.00 NO BID -
12. 1 unit Fracture board Php 2,000.00 NO BID -
13. 40 pcs Tag tapes for triage Php 8,000.00 NOBID -
14. 20 pes Reflectorized Vest Php 4,000.00 NO BID -
15. 5 pcs Rope Php 10,000.00 NO BID -
16. 20 pcs Safety googles Php 10,000.00 NO BID -
17. 6 pcs Sledgehammer Php 9,000.00 NO BID -
18. 6 pcs Axe Php 6,000.00 NO BID -
19. 3 units Chain Saw Php 12,000.00 NO BID -
20. 6 units Search Lights LED Php 12,000.00 NO BID -
21. 20 pcs Rechargeable Flashlight Php 4,000.00 NO BID -
22. 12 units Handheld radio Php 10,800.00 NO BID -
LOT 2
1. 3 unit Automated External Defibrillator Php 600,000.00 NO BID -
2. 1 unit Oxygen Concentrator Php 100,000.00 Php 65,000.00 35% Favorable
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Name of Bidder ABC Bid Amount % of Variance
SPRING DEVELOPMENT CORP. from ABC
LOT 1
23. 4 units OQutdoor Siren Warning System Php 640,000.00 Php 599,888.00 6.2675% Favorable
24. 5 units Trauma Kit Php 100,000.00 Php 60,000.00 40% Favorable
25. 6 units First Aid Kit Basic Php 24,000.00 Php 11,880.00 50.5% Favorable
26. 2 units Folding Cot Php 12,000.00 Php 6,960.00 42% Favorable
27. 1 unit Folding Stretcher Php 8,000.00 Php 5,980.00 25.25% Favorable
28. 2 units Wheelchair Php 12,000.00 Php 10,960.00 8.666% Favorable
29. 30 pcs Hard Hat Php 6,000.00 Php 5,640.00 6% Favorable
30. 1 unit Blinker light Php 2,000.00 Php 4,000.00 100% Unfavorable
31. 2 units Megaphone Php 6,000.00 Php 5,700.00 5% Favorable
32. 5 pcs Fire blanket Php 5,000.00 Php 4,400.00 12% Favorable
33. 5 pcs Thermal Blanket Php 500.00 Php 4,400.00 780% Unfavorable
34. 1 unit Fracture board Php 2,000.00 Php 8,000.00 300% Unfavorable
35. 40 pcs Tag tapes for triage Php 8,000.00 Php 15,200.00 90% Unfavorable
36. 20 pes Reflectorized Vest Php 4,000.00 Php 3,760.00 6% Favorable
37. 5 pcs Rope Php 10,000.00 Php 115,000.00 1050% Unfavorable
38. 20 pcs Safety googles Php 10,000.00 Php 5.000.00 50% Favorable
39. 6 pcs Sledgehammer Php 9,000.00 Php 8,928.00 0.8% Favorable
40. 6 pcs Axe Php 6,000.00 Php 9,000.00 50% Unfavorable
41. 3 units Chain Saw Php 12,000.00 Php 45,000.00 275% Unfavorable
42. 6 units Search Lights LED Php 12,000.00 Php 9,000.00 25% Favorable
43, 20 pcs Rechargeable Flashlight Php 4,000.00 Php 4,000.00 -
44. 12 units Handheld radio Php 10,800.00 Php 9,000.00 16.6666% Favorable
LOT 2
3. 3 unit Automated External Defibrillator Php 600,000.00 Php 570,000.00 5% Favorable
4. 1 unit Oxygen Concentrator Php 100,000.00 Php 90,000.00 10% Favorable

WHEREAS, upon careful examination, validation and verification of all the eligibility, technical and financial
requirements submitted by the Bidder and facts gathered during our post qualification, the following bids has been
found to be Responsive:

JOSMEF ENTERPRISES Amount
Item Description
1. 1 unit Oxygen Concentrator Php 65,000.00
TOTAL: Php 65,000.00
SPRING DEVELOPMENT CORP., Amount
Item Description
1. 4 units OQutdoor Siren Warning System Php 599,888.000
2. 5 units Trauma Kit Php 60,000.00
3. 6 units First Aid Basic Php 11,880.00
4. 2 units Folding Cot Php 6,960.00
5. 1 unit Folding Stretcher Php 5,980.00
6. 2 units Wheelchair Php 10,960.00
7. 30 units Hard hat Php 5,640.00
8. 2 units Megaphone Php 5,700.00
9. 5 units Fire blanket Php 4,400.00
10. 20 units Reflectorized Vest Php 3,760.00
11. 20 units Safety googles Php 5,000.00
12. 6 units Sledgehammer Php 8,928.00
13. 6 units LED Search light Php 9,000.00




14. 20 LED Rechargeable Flashlight

Php 4,000.00

15. 12 units Handheld Radio

Php 9,000.00

16. 3 units Automated External Debribrillator

Php570,000.00

TOTAL:

Php 1,321,096.00

NOW, THEREFORE, We, the Members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby RESOLVE as it is hereby

RESOLVED:

a) To declare JOSMEF ENTERPPRISES and SPRING DEVELOPMENT CORPORATION as the
Bidders with the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid for the Supply and Delivery of Medical and

Disaster Response Equipment;

b) To recommend for award of the contract by the Chancellor of UP Cebu.

RESOLVED, this 17" day of August 2020.
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LOREL S. DEE
BAC Chairman

ROBERTO C. BASADRE

BAC Vice-Chairperson BAC Alt. Vice-Chairperson

EM O. GANDIONCO CAMILLE E. CAPUTOL
AC Member BAC Member
Approved by:

TIFFANY ADELAINE G. TAN

MARILOU B. MANTE

BAC Member
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LYNDON W. LISONDRA

BAC Alternate Member
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LIZA D. CORRO
Chancellor



